
From: Fleming, Jeffrey M
To: Lueders, Amy L
Subject: Re: [EXTERNAL] Are we good with the funding?
Date: Tuesday, September 26, 2023 7:07:00 AM

The check was deposited last week and is available for expenditure. 

From: Lueders, Amy L <amy_lueders@fws.gov>
Sent: Monday, September 25, 2023 8:45 PM
To: Fleming, Jeffrey M <jeffrey_m_fleming@fws.gov>
Subject: Re: [EXTERNAL] Are we good with the funding?
 
Thx.  I’ll hold off in responding to Gwynne til I hear from you

Get Outlook for iOS

From: Fleming, Jeffrey M <jeffrey_m_fleming@fws.gov>
Sent: Monday, September 25, 2023 8:44:49 PM
To: Lueders, Amy L <amy_lueders@fws.gov>
Subject: Re: [EXTERNAL] Are we good with the funding?
 
Yes, that is my understanding.  Give me first thing in the morning to verify doubly.  

From: Lueders, Amy L <amy_lueders@fws.gov>
Sent: Monday, September 25, 2023 8:19 PM
To: Fleming, Jeffrey M <jeffrey_m_fleming@fws.gov>
Subject: Fwd: [EXTERNAL] Are we good with the funding?
 
Confirming that you are not hearing anything from deputies call that would suggest an answer
different than Yes. Let me know.  Thx

Get Outlook for iOS

From: Gwynne Shotwell <Gwynne.Shotwell@spacex.com>
Sent: Monday, September 25, 2023 5:16 PM
To: Lueders, Amy L <amy_lueders@fws.gov>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Are we good with the funding?
 
 

 This email has been received from outside of DOI - Use caution before clicking on
links, opening attachments, or responding.  

Hi Amy!  I hope you got home smoothly after our meeting. 
 



I am also checking on the status of the funding that we worked last week.  I just want to verify that
the Starship environmental activity will continue full force if there is (hopefully not, but…) a
government shutdown.    Can you confirm?
 
Thank you again and it was good to chat last week!
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